
DAY 4

John 17:3a
* Arms folded for John, bounce head. Right 
hand, palm forward, touch thumb to ring finger 
and bounce (this is the sign for 17), then show 3 
fingers. (In sign language you use the first two 
fingers and the thumb to show 3.)

Now this is
* At “this” point right hand to floor. At “is” 
point left hand to floor.

eternal life:
* One finger pointing up goes around twice (like 
“This Little Light of Mine”). This means forever. 
With the same hand, pull your first finger in, put 
your thumb and pinky finger out making a “y,” 
turn your palm to face forward, and slide your 
whole hand out, away from the person. This 
means continuous and never ending. Keep this 
hand up and point for next part!

that they know you,
* Point first finger on right hand up, pointing at 
the sky by the time you sing “you.”

the only true God,
* Point first finger on left hand and point out 
and then up, pointing at the sky by the time you 
sing “true.”

* Both hands come down when you say “God.”

and Jesus Christ… 
* Palms open, taking your pointer or middle 
finger on one hand, touch the middle of the 
other hand’s palm. This reminds us of the nails 
in Jesus’ hand. Then do the same with the other 
hand. So that on “Jesus” you touch one palm 
and on “Christ” you touch the other palm.

Spoken section:
* Bend down, with first finger point to your hand 4 times to the music. Point to your temple 4 times. 
Point to the sky 4 times. Then stand with arms crossed for reference and do 17:3 like before.
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